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Passage is a multi-purpose word.
It can be found in many spheres, 
from travel to literature and 
music. It suggests movement, 
fluidity and transition from one 
place to another. The Passage 
collection is no less versatile. 

The Passage chair is composed 
of a soft and fluid aluminium 
structure, where slides over a 
backrest made from a single 
piece of extruded aluminium.
The seat can be made from a 
single piece of aluminium, but 
it can also be made from wood, 
fabric, rope, webbing or straw.
The variety of seat finishes gives 
this object a unique adaptability.
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Cabo Rope Strap Synthetic Fiber Aluminium
(only avaliable for Chair & 
Stackable armchair)

Outdoor Seat options
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Maintenance

Clean with mild soap using 
a sponge or cloth. Be gentle 
during the cleaning process; 
avoid aggressive scrubbing 
of the seater. After cleaning, 
ensure you remove any excess 
soap.

For stubborn stains, use diluted 
household bleach. Act promptly 
to clean stains; the longer they 
linger, the more challenging they 
become to remove.

Other Characteristics

Stackable 4 u.

Click here or scan the following QR code.

Finishes
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https://media.kettal.es/press/specsheet/PASSAGE_Finishes_Chair.pdf

