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This design comes from the 
traditional chairs made of 
bulrush (Enea) this universal 
design is very common in 
different parts of the world: from 
Mediterranean areas until places 
in north of Europe.

Throughout the years many up-
dates designs have been made: 
wood, plastic. Triconfort enea 
it´s an outdoor version made in 
aluminium with synthetic fibers.
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TABLE TOP KS1400500 90x90
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Adjustable legs 

Maintenance

Clean with mild soap using 
sponge or cloth. Be gentle 
while cleaning, do not scrub 
aggressively the fabric. Once 
cleaned please make sure you 
remove soap excess.
In case of aggressive stains 
clean with diluted household 
bleach.
Clean stains promptly. The 
longer it remains, more difficult 
will be to remove.

Once cleaned the fabric steam 
iron the fabric. Just use steam, 
be carefull  NOT placeing the 
iron directly in the fabric it will 
get damage.

Finishes

Other Characteristics

Click here or scan the following QR code.

https://media.kettal.es/press/specsheet/BASICS_Finishes_Table.pdf

